RFB 28-17JUN26 - Shop Fluids - Term & Supply

Safety-Kleen MFA Oil Ed Miller Auto Supply Rush Truck Centers of Missouri
Item # Unit of D iption Quantity Brand Unit Price Price Brand Unit Price Price Brand Unit Price Price Brand Unit Price Price
) ) Work Horse X-TRA GUARD
Universal Tractor Fluid per 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid oricHorse $1,223.75 $9,790.00 Napa 85455 $845.25 $6,762.00 Valvoline $740.00 $5,920.00
; UTF 420100
491 55 GAL 22.1.
Service Interval) per paragraph Work Horse HD SAE 15W-40 .
292 SsGAL |29 8 Performance Plus $590.70 $4,725.60 (LK.A/SM) 420056 $1,104.95 $8,839.60 Napa 75128 $896.67 $7,173.36 Valvoline $612.00 $4,896.00
Hydraulic Oil (ISO-46) per Work Horse Industrial .
193 SSGAL 23 8 Performance Plus $500.50 $4,004.00 Hydvaulic 150 46 420027 $968.00 $7,744.00 Napa 85855 $830.81 $6,646.48 Valvoline $518.00 $4,144.00
Hydraulic Oil (ISO-68) per Work Horse Industrial )
o4 S GAL 24 8 No Response $544.84 $4,358.72 Hychaulic 150 68 420031 988.35 $7,906.80 Napa 85755 $875.11 $7,000.88 Valvoline $900.00 $7,200.00
Coolant (Universal extended-life " " " Work Horse HD ELEC RED "
495 TOAL | per s 60 No Bid No Bid No Bid 50/50 882462 $13.04 $782.40 Napa RTULEXT $8.34 $500.40 Valvoline $7.25 $435.00
Coolant — Fleet Charge or equal,
‘ : Work Horse HD ELC RED
heavy-duty extended life coolant. 10 Performance Plus $382.20 $3,822.00 or S o?srsoessz 263 $695.20 $6,952.00 Peak FAF FCAWS1 $461.56 $4,615.60 Valvoline $375.00 $3,750.00
496 55 GAL _|50/50 per h22.6.
Work Horse Synthetic 75W90
5GAL __ MFA Oil bid Alternate ! GL5 420003 5 GAL PAIL $182.20 $182.20
1QT  |Gear Lubricant SAE 75-90W full 24 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Napa 891350 $12.82 $307.68 Valvoline $7.75 $186.00
4.9.7 synthetic gear per h 2.2.7.
Gear Lubricant SAE 75-90W full Work Horse Synthetic 75W30 )
Perf Pl 1,552.45 1,552.45 1,643.95 1,643.95 LUC 10072 157.55 157.55 Valvol 1,755.00 1,755.00
498 55GAL |synthetic gearper h22.7. ! eriormance Plus 5L 51 g15 420005 51 51 $ $ alvoline 51 51,
‘ 5142 (Cartri MFA Oil Sho-Me G
pox |Complex NLGI#2 (Cartridge) per 40 Performance Plus $48.85 $1,954.00 1 Sho-Me Grease $152.40 $6,096.00 VAL70124 $4.92 $196.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid
499 h22.8 420208
Grease — High Temperature Multi- )
BOX Purpose HD, NLG1 (Cartridge) per 40 Performance Plus $87.80 $3,512.00 MFA Oil Work Horse Total $165.60 $6,624.00 Napa 914080 $4.43 $177.20 Valvoline $33.10 $1,324.00
Use Grease 420203
49.10 h229.
Global Full Synthetic per paragraph Work Horse Synthetic Multi- . .
a0t ssGaL 210, 8 Performance Plus $1,041.10 $8,328.80 Vehnelo ATE 420066 $1,429.45 $11,435.60 Prime PGLVMVATF55 $1,058.12 $8,464.96 Valvoline (10/box) $920.00 $7,360.00
Automatic Transmission Fluid —
Dexron ULB / Mercon ULV per 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid w326 $1,382.60 $5,530.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid
49.12 55 GAL h22.11.
4013 QTs Dexron "JLZBZ/ l“l"““" ULV per 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid VAL 888460 $8.28 $828.00 Valvoline $8.50 $850.00
Allison TES-668 Approved Fluids 3 performance Plus $2,024.66 $6,073.98 No Bid No Bid No Bid SHE 550062005 $2,616.96 $7,850.88 Valvoline $1,465.00 $4,395.00
4.9.14. 55GAL _|per 2212,
Titan ATF 5668 5 Gallon pail
235. 7,776.4
5 GAL __|MFA Oil bid Alternate 3 660638 523565 $7.776.45
Engine Oil - SAE 0W-20 Full ID Street OW20 FS SQ/GF7A )
4915 1AT | e per o 60 Performance Plus $4.38 $262.80 421028 $24.75 $1,485.00 Napa 75540 $5.87 $352.20 Valvoline $4.80 $288.00
Engine Oil — SAE 0W-20 Full D Street OW20 FS SQ/GF7A ’ : ’
1016 S5 GAL | e per h2a 13 2 Performance Plus $731.04 $1,462.08 421024 $1,204.50 $2,409.00 Napa 75545 $1,057.92 $2,115.84 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Engine Oil - SAE SW-40 Full Work Horse HD SAE 5W-40 )
017 S5 GAL | e per 24 6 Performance Plus $1,611.55 $9,669.30 (CXA/SM) 420048 $1,612.05 $9,672.30 Napa 895046 $1,221.81 $7,330.86 Valvoline $1,432.00 $8,592.00
1QT Engine Oil ~SAE SW-20 Full 60 Performance Plus $4.38 $262.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid Napa 75530 $5.87 $352.20 Valvoline $4.65 $279.00
4.9.18 Synthetic per paragraph 2.2.15
Engine Oil - SAE SW-20 Full ExceDE Full Syn 5W-20 )
910 S5 GAL | e per h2a1s 8 Performance Plus $731.04 $5,848.32 SQ/GF-7A 421010 $1,255.10 $10,040.80 Napa 75154 $836.69 $6,693.52 Valvoline $1,120.00 $8,960.00
ine Oil — 2 ID Street 5W30 FS SQ/GF7A
55GAL |Eneine Oil - SAE SW-30 Full 8 Performance Plus $731.04 $5,848.32 ree Q $1,204.50 $9,636.00 Napa 75525 $829.99 $6,639.92 Valvoline $950.00 $7,600.00
49.20 Synthetic per 22.16 421023
Engine Oil - SAE 5W-30 Full 1D Street 5W30 FS SQ/GF7A )
2021 1AT | et per 2216 60 Performance Plus $4.38 $262.80 21027 $26.55 $1,593.00 Napa 75050 $5.87 $352.20 Valvoline $4.50 $270.00
1022 1QT ‘2"’2‘”157' Steering Fluid per paragraph 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Napa 9832 $4.66 $55.92 Fleetrite $8.00 $96.00
MAG 1 Power Steering Fluid
120Z. " 1\1¢A Ol bid Alternate S 882037 s3.44 $258.00
1023 2.5-GAL Efsl‘;] Exhaust Fluid per paragraph 75 No Bid No Bid No Bid Musket $3.44 $258.00 Napa NPF002 $8.99 $674.25 Armor Blue $10.00 $750.00
Dicsel Exhaust Fluid per paragraph ) ) ) ) ) ) )
1920 3B0GAL |0 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid MFA Oil Bulk DEF $2.54 $25.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid Musket $825.00 $8,250.00
Ed Miller Auto Supply bid alternate 1 BULK $907.50 $907.50
50 ft. Heavy Duty Reel per paragraph 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid 920308 - Balcrank 50'x 1/2 $636.66 $636.66 LIC 94300 $432.53 $432.53 No Bid No Bid No Bid
4.9.25. 22.19. hose & reel
Electronic Meter per paragraph . " . 920307 - Balcrank Digital y ’ : ’
4026, rar S 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid Ruad Ol Moter $338.58 $338.58 BK 825-5038 $386.33 $386.33 No Bid No Bid No Bid
y Electronic Meter per paragraph " " " 920307 - Balcrank Digital g . . .
4927, 1GAL |0 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid Raad Ol Metor $338.58 $338.58 BK 825-5038 $386.33 $386.33 No Bid No Bid No Bid
4028 EA (Optional) 25 21 251““’ Pump per 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid BKN LICK40600SSU $162.02 $162.02 No Bid No Bid No Bid
311 air operated panther
EA 865.08 865.08
MFA Oil bid Alternate pump 920302 $ $
A5 Maximum percentage increase for renewal periods 10% 50% 10% 50%
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Ed Miller Auto Supply

Rush Truck Centers of Missouri

RFB 28-17JUN26 - Shop Fluids - Term & Suppl "
P PPl Safety-Kleen MFA Oil
Item # Unit of [Description Quantity Brand [ unitPrice | Price Brand [ UnitPrice Price Brand [ Unit Price [ Price Brand [ unitprice | Price
Minimum Discount from list for all products not o No Response o 10%
4.11. specified herein
4.12.  |Delivery After Receipt of Order (Calendar Days) 7 10 1 day or what market allows 5
4.8.1. Prompt Payment Terms n/a Net30 Net30 Netd5
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